
Ave Sophia Demelemester <ave@musicestonia.eu>

Estonian charts application
2 kirja

Ave Sophia Tölpt <ave@musicestonia.eu> 18. jaanuar 2025, kell 01:58
Saaja: David <david@rangercom.com>

Dear David,

I hope the year has started well for you! We kicked off the season with the Estonian delegation at Eurosonic and I'm
now taking some time off. Before that, I wanted to inform you of the following:

I’m submitting an application for funding to initiate new possibilities for collaboration this year. Could you please
confirm if the prices have changed, or if we can still count on the following options:
a) £9,000 for a three-year contract.
b) £10,000 with a possible termination by November 30, followed by a £9,000 two-year contract thereafter.
c) £11,000 for a one-year agreement, with a possible fixed offer of £10,000 for the second year.

Thanks so much!

Best regards,
Ave

--
Ave Sophia Maria Tölpt 
Director of Music Estonia 
ave@musicestonia.eu 
(+372) 5688 1366

David <david@rangercom.com> 22. jaanuar 2025, kell 22:58
Saaja: Ave Sophia Tölpt <ave@musicestonia.eu>
Koopia: Emma Jones <emma@rangercomputers.com>

Hello Ave

Great to hear from you! I’m so sorry for the slow response - I’m travelling at the moment and only just picked up your
mail.

It’s good news that you are considering the project again. We will be very pleased to make an agreement! Regarding
prices, there will need to be an inflation adjustment of approximately 5% over last year, but the basis of the pricing
remains the same.

I hope that helps and look forward to hearing from you.

Best regards, David

On 17 Jan 2025, at 12:28, Ave Sophia Tölpt <ave@musicestonia.eu> wrote:

[Osundatud tekst on peidetud]
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